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SUPPLEMENTAL POVERTY MEASURE THRESHOLDS: IMPUTING
SCHOOL LUNCH AND WIC BENEFITS TO THE CONSUMER
EXPENDITURE SURVEY USING THE CURRENT POPULATION SURVEY

BiblioGov. Paperback. Book Condition: New. This item is printed on demand. Paperback. 40 pages. Dimensions:
9.7in. x 7.4in. x 0.1in.In March 2010 an Interagency Technical Working Group (ITWG) released guidelines on
thresholds and resources for a Supplemental Poverty Measure (SPM). The ITWG recommended that thresholds
include in-kind benefits that are accounted for in resources; however, only limited in-kind benefit information is
available in the Consumer Expenditure Survey (CE) Interview component, the data source upon which the
thresholds are based. For example, the CE collects information on food expenditures that implicitly include the
cash value of benefits from the Supplemental Nutrition Assistance Program (SNAP) but no information on other
food programs. This study introduces a new method, the CPS Program Participation Method, of imputing
benefits for the National School Lunch Program (NSLP) and the Women, Infants, and Children program (WIC).
In this study, data from the Current Population Survey (CPS), the data source upon which the SPM resource
measure is based, are used to model the participation of CE households in the NSLP and WIC using the CPS
Program Participation Method. These CPSbased participation rates for NSLP and WIC are then used along with
U. S. Department of Agriculture information to assign benefit levels to the CE households. Thresholds based on
the CPS Program Participation Method are produced for 2009 and compared to thresholds based on a method
based on program eligibility guidelines, the CE Eligibility Method. SPM thresholds are produced by housing
types as well as overall. No poverty rates using these thresholds are produced. Results reveal that the CE
Eligibility Method overall threshold is higher than the CPS Program Participation Method overall threshold. This
is not surprising since the CE threshold is based on eligibility while the CPS threshold is based on program
participation. The paired CE and CPS...
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